
Release The Hounds VII
Final Tally - 7th Annual Match - September 25, 2004

Front Back Total Putts Awards

Bad Dog 42 40 82 33 K.P. Front

Bull Dog 38 39 77 31 Glenfiddich Cup

Scottie Dog 43 39 82 31 Low Net

Moon Dog 43 40 83 30 L.D. Back

Team Score 166 158 324 125

Front Back Total Putts Awards

Chi Hua Hua 45 38 83 33

Great Dane 54 38 92 32

Stray Dog 52 35 87 39 Most Putts & L.D. Front

Tail Hound 44 35 79 30

Team Score 195 146 341 134

Front Back Total Putts Awards

Electric Dog 46 35 81 33

Super Dog 52 39 91 32

Snoop Dog 48 39 87 30

Found Hound 54 35 89 33

Team Score 200 148 348 128

Front Back Total Putts Awards

Deputy Dog 48 42 90 35

Bird Dog 51 43 94 33

Brown Dog Breath 40 43 83 29 Least Putts (tie)

Lap Dog 50 42 92 29 Least Putts (tie)

Team Score 189 170 359 126

Front Back Total Putts Awards

Shaggy Dog 44 40 84 30

Joe Dog 62 40 102 38

Dingo 53 42 95 31 L.D. Back

Skippy Corgi 54 42 96 36

Team Score 213 164 377 135

Front Back Total Putts Awards

Coone Hound 43 39 82 32 K.P. Back

Grey Hound 49 39 88 32

Mad Dog 60 39 99 36 Straight Drive

Chien Chaud 45 39 84 33

Team Score 197 156 353 133

2004 TEAM CHAMPIONS2004 TEAM CHAMPIONS



RTH VII Summary Notes

Well lads, another splendid outing into history. The 2004 event had a great number of outstanding
moments that will be cherished for years to come. To help you recall, the following are a few highlights:

Our first Found Hound, who turned up through the morning Fundy mist beckoned by the sweet
sound of Super Dog’s pipes. His adventurous spirit captured the essence of the ‘Gathering of
the Hounds’

The Parade, lead by Scottie Dog waving the Glenfiddich flag. (”No bumping, I didn’t give you
permission and I don’t know you”) What was going through the minds of the couples in the Rv’s
that were forced off the road at the Park Headquarters, when the encountered the sword
wielding, scotch drinking, howling Scotsmen racing down the hill on golf carts.

The awards ceremony included spontaneous singing which we hope to feature as a fixture in
next years pillage. Snoop Dog and Shaggy have been tasked with this file. Typically there a
major surprise for the coveted awards, Moon Dog or Stray Dog? - L.D. Front and Dingo L.D.
Back beating out our normal heavy hitters. Scottie most improved low-net - well done, and
congratulations to Bull Dog for the break through year as and our 2004 Glenfiddich Cup
Champion.

Hounds love their food and it was plentiful and mouth watering. The lunch by House Dog (who
missed this years event) hit the spot at the turn. The banquet put on by the MacIntyre Brothers
was out standing and in the words of Mad Dog “the food at Bad Dog’s Place on Saturday night
was worthy of a top class restaurant.” Electric Dog was over heard to say “Jorgensen Electric
could sponsor a breakfast buffet next year. More Food!

Mad Dog put on a magnificent scotch tasting. He managed to fit the Fundy Gig into his travels
between Bagdad and Kazakhstan. The tasting was a deafening silence compared to the
shouting and howling during the rest of the night except for “ ”

The fireworks sponsored by Timberparts (who also missed this years event) were put off and put
off because of wind, although at 2am, I believe there was a feeble display fo store bought
candles. The fireworks are stored safely and will be combined with next years pyro for an
outstanding display.

Finally we launched the website and signed the Export ‘A’ Lassie for a multi year contract to
model the boutique collection.

Have a great winter lads.

Coone Hound - Chairman responsible for International Relations and telecommunications.

Bad Dog - Chairman responsible for Domestic Relations and Hospitality (Keeper of the Boutique)

awh! could I have another please?
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Electric Dog Leads a Song

The Hound Parade Marshall

Presentation of Team Championship Trophy

L.D. BackL.D. Front K.P. Front K.P. Back

Low NetMost Putts Straight Drive L.D. Back So You re Single


